
Elms Farm Angus Beef 
Terms of Sale 

 
Customer Order and Terms of Payment 
 
You will complete a Processing Order with Donald E Hunters Meats, 4612 Turkey Road, 
Hillsboro, OH 45133 (“Hunter Meats”) to process the cattle.  The Processing Order form 
is available on our website.  When you have completed and delivered it to us, we will 
deliver it to Hunters Meats.  The Processing Order is a separate contract from this 
contract to buy beef from Elms Farm Angus Beef.   
 
You agree to pay Elms Farm Angus Beef a down payment of $800 for a whole beef, $400 
for a half beef , and $200 for a quarter beef at the time you fill out the Processing Order 
and sign these Terms of Sale.  The balance due will be paid in full by personal check 
payable to Elms Farm Angus Beef upon your receipt of an invoice that will be sent to you 
when you pick up the order at Hunter Meats.   It is your responsibility to pick up your 
Order.  Elms Farm Angus Beef will make arrangements for delivery of the cattle to 
Hunter Meats at no extra charge to you. 
 
You will pay Hunter Meats separately for the processing of the beef.  In the event you do 
not meet Hunter Meats’ pick-up schedule, you may also be required to pay Hunter Meats 
a storage fee. 
 
Waiver of Liability and Assumption of Meat Processing Risk 

 
Neither Elms Farms Marketing, LLC (dba Elms Farm Angus Beef) nor Elms Farms, Inc. 
has any affiliation with or responsibility for the services provided by Hunter Meats.  You 
hereby release, waive, and discharge Elms Farm Angus Beef and Elms Farm, Inc., and 
their officers, shareholders, members, employees, or agents from liability for any and all 
claims resulting in personal injury or illnesses (including death) and property loss relating 
to your purchase or consumption of beef purchased from Elms Farm Angus Beef.  You 
accept all risk of damage to or loss of the cattle as of the time they are delivered to the 
processor. The foregoing waiver and release is binding on you and your heirs, personal 
representatives, and assigns. 
 
 
___ Whole Beef           
      Customer’s Signature   
 
___ Half Beef           
      Printed Name and Date 
 
 ___ Quarter Beef 
 
 


